A

Inverness County

TAX SALE RESULTS: July 6th, 2018

See Below, results of the Tax Sale held by the Municipality of the County of Inverness on July 6th, 2018 at 10:00am at 375 Main Street, Port Hood, NS.

Total

Lien AAN Assessed Owner Description Owing | Redeemable? Result
1 |06458224 kerey-S-Austin 2--MaeknisRd PAD Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
2 |89535780 |Jesie-Ariganele BarrenRd PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE

3 107202024 |Karla Jean Bagley 15 Troy Garden Lane 6,059.10 Yes NO BID
4 109334971 |Michaeljon Blue General Line Road 1,373.12 Yes 3,000.00

o [04955218 fg::ger' Lawrence & Leonard Boyd & Simon 5229 Highway 105 2,013.38 Yes 201338

6 03932117 |Hana Butt Old Cabot Trail 1,138.48 Yes 1,500.00
7 |60610453 (MichaelcCameron-Estate 1395-Coady-Road PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
8 |00618403 |ColinTitusCampbelt 43 Maelsaae St PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
9 01774026 |Hannah Graham 259 East Big Intervale Rd 1,465.05 Yes 1,465.05
10 |00152099 [Nicola Hasse 12669 Cabot Trail 1,739.45 Yes 3,900.00
13 (89617205 |Brendon-&Cynthiakennedy 5298 CabotFrai- PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
12 |07948301 |Dietrich W Kluth Ross Point Rd 3,432.32 Yes 35,000.00
13 82499509 |Mark-Ateblane 15923 CentratAve PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
14 105165709 |Allan C & Ann C MacDonald Hwy 395 1,186.05 Yes NO BID
15 (02678292 |Bavid-A-Macbonald 103 GlenRd PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
16 (02678128 |Bavid-Macbenald 181 Highway-395 PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
17 [10458633 [Duncan MacDonald Fougere Rd 1,007.00 Yes 1,007.00
18 (02683717 [Duncan MacDonald Cleveland-Kingsville 1,972.68 Yes 9,500.00
19 (02683296 [Duncan MacDonald Cleveland-Kingsville 950.70 Yes 3,500.00
20 (00436984 |GlenR-&MaudeMaetnnis 15-Bavisbr PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
21 |02785188 [John Maclntosh Estate Doyles Road 1,244.07 Yes 10,500.00
22 |80253316 |AnAHart&Donatd-W-Maekay Froy PAIB- Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
23 |84086953 |Donatd-Edward-Maeckay WestLake AinsheRd PAIB- Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
24 (05318173 |(Eli Alexander MacKay 166 Alba-lona Rd 2,871.62 Yes 2,871.62
25 (65083079 |Donatd-WatkerMaetellan ShoreRd PAIB Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
26 |01966367 |Beryl & Donald MaclLeod Crandall Road, Sugar Camp 871.46 Yes NO BID
7 (09345345 Brian-S-MacNeit UpperSeuthwestMabou Rd FAB- Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
28 |10475491 |Margaret McFarland Beach Rd 822.73 Yes NO BID
29 |83530027 |Setsuke-Matsunaga-Nishi 923 Mabeou-MinesRd PAIB- Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
30 (00736112 |Northfork Farms Bellum Rd 1,198.69 Yes 1,198.69
31 |05791014 |Northfork Farms Mountain Rd 1,270.20 Yes NO BID
32 |00564699 |Northfork Farms Marsh Brook Rd Margaree Valley 1,013.00 Yes 1,013.00
33 |10006171 |Doreen & Joseph O'Brien General Line Road 1,782.85 Yes 2,500.00
34 103750248 |Karen & Thomas Phillips 1092 West Big Intervale Rd 2,998.60 Yes 7,800.00
35 (83780589 |Joseph-tPoirier Old-taprairieRe- PAIB- Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
36 |03376001 |Marguerite Marie Poirier Cabot Trail Hwy 2,302.68 Yes 2,302.68
37 |03778711 |Marguerite Marie Poirier Cabot Trail 2,184.72 Yes 2,184.72
38 |05336147 |Germaine Pynne Plateau Cross Rd 911.37 Yes 911.37
39 |03893766 |Maurice Arthur Raymond Estate Red River Rd 1,200.69 Yes NO BID
40 |08818304 |WayneHoydSmith MelroseHilt PAID Yes PAID PRIOR TO SALE
41 |00913227 |Consolidated Recreation Association 182 Highway 395 (Whycocomagh) | 7,001.35 Yes 55,000.00
42 104906314 |Rick & Anne M White Laprairie Marsh Rd 1,259.18 Yes NO BID




